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Cuckold Chronicles is a collection of FIVE steamy cuckold stories. It includes:

Naughty Housewife
Vanessa was tired of being a pleasing, yet ignored, housewife. Her husband, a big shot attorney,
continuously ignored her. Fed up and tired of his behavior, Vanessa shows him who is the boss when she
brings a sexy young man into the house and makes her husband watch as she becomes very naughty with this
stranger.

Alicia's First Time
John was a pro at being in a cuckold relationship. His ex-wife had trained him quite well. Missing what he
once had, he begged his hot wife Alicia to find a man that she would feel comfortable with. When they least
expected it, they met an older handsome stranger at an adult store who was looking for an afternoon of fun.
Could John convince his wife to go through with it? Would Alicia like her new bull more than her husband?

Shunned By My Wife
Sheila and I had always been your typical run-of-the-mill ordinary vanilla couple. High school sweethearts
who had only ever experienced each other. That is until my wife and I decided that we needed to spice things
up. I never knew how spicy and heated things were going to get until she met three strangers in a bar and let
them have their way with her in the van out back. As for me? I could only watch and clean her up when they
were done.

On John's Dime
Lonely housewives, Angie and Barbie, have weekly luncheons that allow them some girl time away from
their old, loaded husbands. Typically when they go out to lunch, the ladies use it as an opportunity to gossip
about their friends and their love lives. Neither of the women are happy in their marriages despite having all
the money in the world.

As the two women discuss their boring, non-existent sex lives, their hunk of a waiter knows everything
they're saying. Even though the women are speaking barely above a whisper, the waiter has a unique talent --
he can read lips! He knows that the old men can't keep up with their young, hot wives. Eager to get in on the
action, he confronts the embarrassed women and offers his number -- along with his prices!

Angie must decide whether or not she could go through with cheating on her husband -- she does love him,
doesn't she? Her friend Barbie is of no help as she encourages Angie to give the waiter a call. If Angie
decides to go through with it, she'll be using her rich husband's credit card to pay for sex. Can she do it?
What if she gets caught? John might cut her funds entirely -- or can she use it against him for being suck a
boring old geezer?

Sweet Revenge
Julia was married to one of the most prestigious lawyers in town. Just after her 30th birthday, she could hear
her biological clock ticking away, and she knew time was against her. Eager to become a mother, Julia and



her husband Bill decided that it was time to start their family.

When Julia learned that her husband had a dirty little secret that he'd hidden from her, everything changed.
Julia discovered that her husband had been exploiting his power with the law firm to sleep with hopeful
young interns. She saw red and wanted revenge!

With the help of a young, well-built college intern from her husband's law firm, Julia cuckolded her husband.
Using Thomas as her new bull, she made her husband grovel and plead for her to keep his dirty little affair a
secret...but would she?
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From reader reviews:

Quentin Ryan:

What do you concerning book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what your own problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy individual? If you
don't have spare time to do others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you have
spare time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that
question mainly because just their can do that will. It said that about publication. Book is familiar in each
person. Yes, it is suitable. Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need this particular
Cuckold Chronicles (A Collection of FIVE First Time Cuckold Stories) (Bundle Box Set) to read.

Ella Jacobs:

This Cuckold Chronicles (A Collection of FIVE First Time Cuckold Stories) (Bundle Box Set) book is not
ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading this book is
usually information inside this reserve incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper you read
a lot of information you will get. This Cuckold Chronicles (A Collection of FIVE First Time Cuckold
Stories) (Bundle Box Set) without we comprehend teach the one who studying it become critical in
contemplating and analyzing. Don't become worry Cuckold Chronicles (A Collection of FIVE First Time
Cuckold Stories) (Bundle Box Set) can bring if you are and not make your case space or bookshelves' turn
into full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even cell phone. This Cuckold Chronicles (A
Collection of FIVE First Time Cuckold Stories) (Bundle Box Set) having very good arrangement in word
and layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Mary West:

Now a day those who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not require people to be aware of each facts they get. How individuals to be
smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Reading a book
can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information especially this Cuckold Chronicles (A
Collection of FIVE First Time Cuckold Stories) (Bundle Box Set) book since this book offers you rich data
and knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Jeremy Clayton:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book in
comparison with can satisfy your limited time to read it because this all time you only find book that need
more time to be go through. Cuckold Chronicles (A Collection of FIVE First Time Cuckold Stories) (Bundle
Box Set) can be your answer because it can be read by an individual who have those short time problems.
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