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Settle in with your coloring supplies and enjoy these GRAYSCALED illustrations from the art of Alena
Lazareva.

42 images to color (38 Enchanted Art plus 4 bonus pages)●

Pages printed on one side only●

Full size paper, 8.5x11●

Pure white, 60 lb paper, acid-free for long art life●

Coloring on grayscale is a little different; please use the "Look Inside" feature before purchasing to gauge
whether this book is right for you. There is also a YouTube video to see every page in the
book: youtu.be/n0HlsEwjQ4A (copy and paste in your browser).

Each page is printed on one side only, great for colored pencils; test your gel pens first. Markers will bleed
through and need blotter paper beneath the coloring page. Colorists, you are also welcome to copy the
images onto cardstock for your own use.

Visit the artist at her website: AlenaLazareva.com her beautiful art is available on many things for your
home - phone cases, blankets, throw pillows, posters, etc.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Peterson:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add your
knowledge by the guide entitled Enchanted Art Grayscale Coloring Book: For Grown-Ups, Adult
Relaxation. Try to make book Enchanted Art Grayscale Coloring Book: For Grown-Ups, Adult Relaxation
as your close friend. It means that it can to be your friend when you truly feel alone and beside those of
course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you a lot more
confidence because you can know almost everything by the book. So , we should make new experience and
knowledge with this book.

Donna Cauley:

Book will be written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important thing to bring us around the world.
Adjacent to that you can your reading talent was fluently. A publication Enchanted Art Grayscale Coloring
Book: For Grown-Ups, Adult Relaxation will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel considerably
more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think in which open or reading any
book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you searching for
best book or suited book with you?

Juan Gilbert:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make
anyone to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and soon. You
can view that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The particular book that recommended
to you is Enchanted Art Grayscale Coloring Book: For Grown-Ups, Adult Relaxation this reserve consist a
lot of the information from the condition of this world now. This book was represented so why is the world
has grown up. The dialect styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer
made some exploration when he makes this book. That's why this book suitable all of you.

Joy Becker:

As a college student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library in
order to make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's
soul or real their passion. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go to at this
time there but nothing reading really. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring as well as
can't see colorful images on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for you personally.
As we know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says,



many ways to reach Chinese's country. So , this Enchanted Art Grayscale Coloring Book: For Grown-Ups,
Adult Relaxation can make you sense more interested to read.
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