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When Lucie Montgomery finds the body of prominent wine merchant Paul Noble hanging from a beam in
his art studio not far from her Virginia vineyard, she is unwittingly dragged into Noble s murky past. Once a
member of the secretive Mandrake Society, Noble might have aided in a cover-up of the deaths forty-years
ago of a disabled man and a beautiful young biochemist involved in classified government research.

A seemingly innocent favor for an old friend of her French grandfather s sends Lucie to California where she
teams up with Quinn Santori, who walked out of Lucie s life months earlier. Soon Lucie and Quinn are
embroiled in a deadly cat-and-mouse game that takes them from glittering San Francisco to the legendary
vineyards of Napa and Sonoma, then back home to Virginia as they try to discover whether a killer may be
seeking vengeance for the long-ago deaths.

As Lucie and Quinn struggle to uncover the mystery, they must also decide whether they have a future
together. Blending an intriguing mystery with an absorbing plot, vivid characters, and a richly evoked
setting, The Sauvignon Secret should be savored like a glass of fine wine."
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From reader reviews:

Mary Richie:

Book is written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can realize everything you want by a reserve.
Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important point to bring us around the world. Close
to that you can your reading ability was fluently. A reserve The Sauvignon Secret (Wine Country Mysteries
(Audio)) will make you to always be smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about
everything. But some of you think this open or reading a new book make you bored. It is far from make you
fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you looking for best book or ideal book with you?

Shannon Lynch:

The e-book untitled The Sauvignon Secret (Wine Country Mysteries (Audio)) is the reserve that
recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to a
person. The language that publisher use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand.
The writer was did a lot of investigation when write the book, to ensure the information that they share for
your requirements is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of The Sauvignon Secret (Wine
Country Mysteries (Audio)) from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Dwight Ivers:

With this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more special than
other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you should do is
just spending your time little but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of several books in the top
list in your reading list is actually The Sauvignon Secret (Wine Country Mysteries (Audio)). This book that
is qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking upwards and
review this publication you can get many advantages.

Stanley Rivas:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book was rare? Why so many
problem for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some people likes
studying, not only science book but in addition novel and The Sauvignon Secret (Wine Country Mysteries
(Audio)) or perhaps others sources were given expertise for you. After you know how the truly great a book,
you feel wish to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher or perhaps students especially.
Those textbooks are helping them to bring their knowledge. In different case, beside science guide, any other
book likes The Sauvignon Secret (Wine Country Mysteries (Audio)) to make your spare time more colorful.
Many types of book like here.
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