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The spectacular coastline of Mexico's Yucatan peninsula is a diverse playground where you can bask on
pristine beaches, explore ancient ruins, play golf or tennis, go biking, snorkeling or scuba diving, do serious
shopping, or escape to a secluded lagoon. With info on Cancun, Isla Mujeres, Cozumel, Playa del Carmen
and the Riviera Maya, plus the nearby ruins, this friendly guide gives you the low down on: everything from
unique spa experiences to nature preserves and ecoparks; accommodations ranging from a luxury resort
where guests can dabble in a Viking-clad kitchen or where rooms spread out through the jungle to a
European-style inn that offers Spanish lessons or a peaceful beachside palapa (thatch-roofed) inn; and, all
kinds of dining options, including fresh seafood, regional specialties such as pork pibil, papadzules, and poc
chuc, or Thai, Argentinean, or Italian cuisine.This title also gives you the low down on: diving into the clear
depths of the Yucatan cenotes (natural wells); birding at Isla Contoy, with more than 70 species of birds as
well as a host of marine and animal life; the Panoramic Tower on Isla Mujeres where you get a stunning
view of the island and Cancun; day trips to the archeological sites at Tulum, Chichen Itza, and Ek Balam; the
pedestrian-only Avenida 5 in Playa del Carmen that's the hot social scene; and, night life, including live
music venues, tequila bars, sports bars, cafes, and plenty of places where you can dance the night away. Like
every "For Dummies" travel guide, "Cancun & the Yucatan For Dummies, 3rd Edition" includes: down-to-
earth trip-planning advice; what you shouldn't miss - and what you can skip; the best hotels and restaurants
for every budget; and, handy Post-it[registered] Flags to mark your favorite pages. Whether your idea of the
perfect vacation is action, sun, and non-stop fun or an escape to a peaceful haven where life moves along in
pure manana mode, this guide will get you on your way with no problemo, amigo.
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From reader reviews:

Earl Austin:

Here thing why this specific Cancun & the Yucatan For Dummies are different and reputable to be yours.
First of all reading through a book is good nevertheless it depends in the content than it which is the content
is as scrumptious as food or not. Cancun & the Yucatan For Dummies giving you information deeper
including different ways, you can find any guide out there but there is no book that similar with Cancun &
the Yucatan For Dummies. It gives you thrill examining journey, its open up your eyes about the thing which
happened in the world which is possibly can be happened around you. You can bring everywhere like in
recreation area, café, or even in your technique home by train. When you are having difficulties in bringing
the paper book maybe the form of Cancun & the Yucatan For Dummies in e-book can be your alternative.

Ena Clark:

The e-book with title Cancun & the Yucatan For Dummies contains a lot of information that you can learn it.
You can get a lot of help after read this book. This book exist new information the information that exist in
this guide represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to learn how the
improvement of the world. This particular book will bring you within new era of the the positive effect. You
can read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Viola Boucher:

Precisely why? Because this Cancun & the Yucatan For Dummies is an unordinary book that the inside of
the reserve waiting for you to snap that but latter it will distress you with the secret it inside. Reading this
book next to it was fantastic author who else write the book in such awesome way makes the content within
easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning completely. So , it is good for you
because of not hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book will give you
a lot of rewards than the other book have got such as help improving your proficiency and your critical
thinking means. So , still want to delay having that book? If I had been you I will go to the publication store
hurriedly.

Jessie Loudermilk:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try factor that really opposite from
that. Just one activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
have been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Cancun & the Yucatan For Dummies,
you could enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still desire to miss it? What kind of hang type is it?
Oh can happen its mind hangout men. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its named reading friends.
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