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In The Great Lead Water Pipe Disaster, Werner Troesken looks at a long-running environmental and public
health catastrophe: 150 years of lead pipes in local water systems and the associated sickness, premature
death, political inaction, and social denial. The harmful effects of lead water pipes became apparent almost
as soon as cities the world over began to install them. Doctors and scientists noted cases of acute illness and
death attributable to lead in public water beginning in the middle of the nineteenth century, and an editorial
in the New York Herald called for the city to study the matter after a bizarre illness made headlines in 1868.
But officials took no action for many years. New York City, for example, did not take any steps to reduce
lead levels in water until 1992, long after the most serious damage had been done. By then, in any case,
much of the old lead pipe had been replaced with safer materials.Troesken examines the health effects of
lead exposure, analyzing cases from New York City, Boston, and Glasgow and many smaller towns in
Massachusetts, New Hampshire, and England. He draws on period accounts, government reports, court
decisions, and economic and demographic analysis to document the widespread nature of the problem, the
recognized health effects--particularly for pregnant women and young children--and official intransigence.
He presents an accessible overview of the old and new science of lead exposure--explaining, for example,
why areas with soft water suffered more harmful effects than areas with hard water. And he gives us
compelling and vivid accounts of the people and politics involved. The effects of lead in water continue to be
felt; many older houses still have lead service pipes. The Great Lead Water Pipe Disaster is essential reading
for understanding this past and ongoing public health problem.
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From reader reviews:

Joseph Woodruff:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that will give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can certainly share
their idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their very own reader with
their story or their experience. Not only the story that share in the publications. But also they write about the
data about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
young ones, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on earth always try to improve
their expertise in writing, they also doing some research before they write to the book. One of them is this
The Great Lead Water Pipe Disaster (MIT Press).

Samual Larkin:

The book untitled The Great Lead Water Pipe Disaster (MIT Press) contain a lot of information on that. The
writer explains the woman idea with easy way. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do
definitely not worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was written by famous author. The author will
take you in the new time of literary works. It is easy to read this book because you can please read on your
smart phone, or device, so you can read the book within anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to
purchase the e-book, you can open their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice study.

David Whetstone:

You can obtain this The Great Lead Water Pipe Disaster (MIT Press) by look at the bookstore or Mall. Only
viewing or reviewing it could possibly to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties for ones knowledge.
Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only through written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this
book by means of e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you just looking from your mobile phone and
searching what their problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to get more information about your
guide. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to
choose right ways for you.

Edward Sullivan:

That book can make you to feel relax. This specific book The Great Lead Water Pipe Disaster (MIT Press)
was colorful and of course has pictures around. As we know that book The Great Lead Water Pipe Disaster
(MIT Press) has many kinds or genre. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or
Investigation company Conan you can read and think that you are the character on there. Therefore , not at
all of book tend to be make you bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best
book to suit your needs and try to like reading in which.
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