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I was not in the nursing profession very long before recognizing the "miracle" of the human body. In fact, I
remember while in nursing school, just sitting in awe as we learned all about the body systems and how they
interact with each other! It was while I was in LPN school that the Lord showed me the parallel of His blood
to our blood. You can read about it in the devotion "Life is in the Blood". In this little book I have taken a
nursing concept and applied a biblical principle resulting in a daily devotional for 31 days. It is intended to
bring encouragement and inspiration to nurses as well as other healthcare professionals. All the devotions
have an individual title and scripture reference. Also, at the end of the daily devotion there is a special prayer
I have prayed for the reader. My goal is that for all caregivers who read this little book of devotions to be
assured that the Lord is here to help them in whatever need they may have. He is a personal God who knows
and cares for us individually! Secondly, my goal is to help all caregivers to see how important they are to the
service of the Lord. It is through our hands and words that He often ministers to His people who are sick.
The reader will also get a special treat with two poems written by Belinda Looney. While reading
"Expectations" one will identify very quickly with the early (and comical) expectations of a fresh nursing
graduate! "A Nurse's Prayer" is a poem expressing how many of us feel about nursing but are unable to
convey as beautifully as Belinda has.
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From reader reviews:

Sarita Springer:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to opt for book
like comic, brief story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not attempting Medicine for Nurses
that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading practice all over the
world can be said as the means for people to know world considerably better then how they react in the
direction of the world. It can't be stated constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky person but for all
of you who wants to become success person. So , for all you who want to start reading as your good habit, it
is possible to pick Medicine for Nurses become your current starter.

Pauline Lipman:

Reading a book for being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to learn a book. When you
study a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts
of book that you have read. If you would like get information about your analysis, you can read education
books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics,
and soon. The Medicine for Nurses provide you with new experience in examining a book.

Jimmie Houck:

That book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Medicine for Nurses was vibrant and of course has
pictures around. As we know that book Medicine for Nurses has many kinds or variety. Start from kids until
youngsters. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read and think you are the
character on there. So , not at all of book are make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and chill
out. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading that.

Seth Sutherland:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got scholars? We believe that that question was
given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person similar to reading or as examining become their hobby. You must know that reading
is very important in addition to book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to add you knowledge,
except your current teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update regarding something by book.
Amount types of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is niagra Medicine for Nurses.
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