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Based on actual events, OPEN SOURCE is a geopolitical thriller that follows Casey Shenk, a Savannah,
Georgia, vending route driver with an insatiable curiosity, as he uncovers a black-market arms deal-gone-bad
and the truth behind a high-level plot to shape world politics. Casey draws his evidence from open sources--
by reading beyond the headlines. When his theorizing catches the attention of the wrong people and
anonymous threats turn deadly, Casey looks to Susan Williams, an intelligent, but insecure, analyst for the
New York-based consulting firm Intelligence Watch Group for help. The two soon find themselves in the
crosshairs and fighting to save their own lives, while preventing an even greater injustice that could affect
the balance of power in the Middle East and plunge the world headlong into the next Great War.
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From reader reviews:

Ernie Swisher:

Book is definitely written, printed, or created for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important matter to bring us around the
world. Close to that you can your reading skill was fluently. A guide Open Source will make you to always
be smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think in
which open or reading any book make you bored. It is not necessarily make you fun. Why they can be
thought like that? Have you in search of best book or appropriate book with you?

Lewis Manns:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what your own problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy man or woman?
If you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have
free time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. They need to answer that question
because just their can do that. It said that about book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is right.
Because start from on pre-school until university need that Open Source to read.

Mary Tiller:

Now a day folks who Living in the era just where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not involve people to be aware of each data they get. How many people to
be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Studying a book can
help individuals out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Open Source book since this book offers
you rich data and knowledge. Of course the information in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no
doubt in it you know.

Jeremy Bedford:

Is it a person who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by means of watching television
programs or just resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This Open Source can be the respond to,
oh how comes? The new book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your time by reading in this
brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?
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