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In September, 1219, as the armies of the Fifth Crusade besieged the Egyptian city of Damietta, Francis of
Assisi went to Egypt to preach to Sultan al-Malik al-Kâmil.
Although we in fact know very little about this event, this has not prevented artists and writers from the
thirteenth century to the twentieth, unencumbered by mere facts, from portraying Francis alternatively as a
new apostle preaching to the infidels, a scholastic theologian proving the truth of Christianity, a champion of
the crusading ideal, a naive and quixotic wanderer, a crazed religious fanatic, or a medieval Gandhi
preaching peace, love, and understanding. Al-Kâmil, on the other hand, is variously presented as an
enlightened pagan monarch hungry for evangelical teaching, a cruel oriental despot, or a worldly libertine.
Saint Francis and the Sultan takes a detailed look at these richly varied artistic responses to this brief but
highly symbolic meeting. Throwing into relief the changing fears and hopes that Muslim-Christian
encounters have inspired in European artists and writers in the centuries since, it gives a uniquely broad but
precise vision of the evolution of Western attitudes towards Islam and the Arab world over the last eight
hundred years.
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From reader reviews:

Allison Sala:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the e-book entitled Saint Francis and the Sultan: The Curious History of a Christian-Muslim
Encounter. Try to make book Saint Francis and the Sultan: The Curious History of a Christian-Muslim
Encounter as your buddy. It means that it can to get your friend when you really feel alone and beside that of
course make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you
considerably more confidence because you can know anything by the book. So , let's make new experience
along with knowledge with this book.

Aimee Simmons:

The knowledge that you get from Saint Francis and the Sultan: The Curious History of a Christian-Muslim
Encounter will be the more deep you excavating the information that hide in the words the more you get
considering reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to understand but Saint Francis and the Sultan:
The Curious History of a Christian-Muslim Encounter giving you thrill feeling of reading. The article writer
conveys their point in selected way that can be understood simply by anyone who read this because the
author of this e-book is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your own personal vocabulary
increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style
are available. We recommend you for having that Saint Francis and the Sultan: The Curious History of a
Christian-Muslim Encounter instantly.

Eileen Vaughan:

The book untitled Saint Francis and the Sultan: The Curious History of a Christian-Muslim Encounter
contain a lot of information on the item. The writer explains the woman idea with easy approach. The
language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read this. The
book was published by famous author. The author will take you in the new period of literary works. It is
possible to read this book because you can read on your smart phone, or model, so you can read the book
throughout anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can start their official
web-site and also order it. Have a nice learn.

Billy Doyle:

This Saint Francis and the Sultan: The Curious History of a Christian-Muslim Encounter is completely new
way for you who has attention to look for some information because it relief your hunger associated with.
Getting deeper you into it getting knowledge more you know otherwise you who still having little bit of
digest in reading this Saint Francis and the Sultan: The Curious History of a Christian-Muslim Encounter can
be the light food for yourself because the information inside this kind of book is easy to get simply by



anyone. These books acquire itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book type.
People who think that in reserve form make them feel tired even dizzy this e-book is the answer. So there is
absolutely no in reading a e-book especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be
here for you actually. So , don't miss it! Just read this e-book type for your better life as well as knowledge.
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