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One-Straw Revolutionary represents the first commentary on the work of the late Japanese farmer and
philosopher Masanobu Fukuoka (1913 – 2008), widely considered to be natural farming’s most influential
practitioner. Mr. Fukuoka is perhaps most known for his bestselling book The One-Straw Revolution (1978),
a manifesto on the importance of no-till agriculture, which was at the time of publication a radical challenge
to the global systems that supply the world’s food, and still inspires readers today. Larry Korn, who
apprenticed with Mr. Fukuoka in Japan at the time, translated the manuscript and brought it to the United
States, knowing it would change the conversation about food forever. The One-Straw Revolution, edited by
Korn and Wendell Berry, was an immediate international success, and established Mr. Fukuoka as a leading
voice in the fight against conventional industrial agriculture. In this new book, through his own personal
narrative, Larry Korn distills his experience of more than thirty-five years of study with Mr. Fukuoka, living
and working on his farm on Shikoku Island, and traveling with Mr. Fukuoka to the United States on two six-
week visits.  

One-Straw Revolutionary is the first book to look deeply at natural farming and intimately discuss the
philosophy and work of Mr. Fukuoka. In addition to giving his personal thoughts about natural farming,
Korn broadens the discussion by pointing out natural farming’s kinship with the ways of indigenous cultures
and traditional Japanese farming. At the same time, he clearly distinguishes natural farming from other forms
of agriculture, including scientific and organic agriculture and permaculture. Korn also clarifies commonly
held misconceptions about natural farming in ways Western readers can readily understand. And he explains
how natural farming can be used practically in areas other than agriculture, including personal growth and
development.

The book follows the author on his travels from one back-to-the-land commune to another in the countryside
of 1970s Japan, a journey that eventually led him to Mr. Fukuoka’s natural farm. Korn’s description of his
time there, as well as traveling with Mr. Fukuoka during his visits to the United States, offers a rare, inside
look at Mr. Fukuoka’s life. Readers will delight in this personal insight into one of the world’s leading
agricultural thinkers.
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From reader reviews:

Ernie Swisher:

The feeling that you get from One-Straw Revolutionary: The Philosophy and Work of Masanobu Fukuoka
will be the more deep you rooting the information that hide inside the words the more you get considering
reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to comprehend but One-Straw Revolutionary: The
Philosophy and Work of Masanobu Fukuoka giving you excitement feeling of reading. The article writer
conveys their point in particular way that can be understood simply by anyone who read it because the author
of this book is well-known enough. This book also makes your vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy
to understand then can go with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you for
having this specific One-Straw Revolutionary: The Philosophy and Work of Masanobu Fukuoka instantly.

Victor Smith:

On this era which is the greater person or who has ability to do something more are more important than
other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you need to do is just
spending your time very little but quite enough to get a look at some books. Among the books in the top
listing in your reading list is actually One-Straw Revolutionary: The Philosophy and Work of Masanobu
Fukuoka. This book which is qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in growing to be precious
person. By looking upward and review this publication you can get many advantages.

Ronald Stauffer:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our information for everything. By a publication we can know
everything we would like. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year has been
exactly added. This reserve One-Straw Revolutionary: The Philosophy and Work of Masanobu Fukuoka was
filled about science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some
people has distinct feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you
can truly feel enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book that you
wanted.

Ann Cason:

Book is one of source of knowledge. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen want book to know the revise information of year to year. As we know those textbooks have
many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the world. Through the
book One-Straw Revolutionary: The Philosophy and Work of Masanobu Fukuoka we can take more
advantage. Don't one to be creative people? Being creative person must choose to read a book. Just simply
choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life at this time book
One-Straw Revolutionary: The Philosophy and Work of Masanobu Fukuoka. You can more desirable than
now.
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