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A highly influential Sudanese reformist thinker, Mahmud Muhammad Taha is regarded as a product of a
dual legacy rooted in mystical Islam on the one hand and in the tradition of modernity on the other. Publicly
executed in 1985 folowing his conviction of apostasy, Taha offered distinctly original interpretations of the
Qur'an and a radical theory of Islamic prayer. In Quest for Divinity, Mohamed Mahmoud presents an in-
depth and balanced treatment of Taha's controversial yet significant thought. The author's ability to provide
access to relevant literature in both Arabic and English offers readers a rare view of the considerable nuance
in Taha's thought. With rich detail Mahmoud explores Taha's theories of human freedom and his social
message, referred to as "the second message of Islam" with its emphasis on political, economic, and social
equality. Taha's embrace of modernity is further assessed relative to his position on science, law, and art-
areas that have always attracted Muslim modernists. Quest for Divinity will attract attention to Taha's
compelling but little-known intellectual contribution as a seminal modern reformer of Islam. Such
recognition is long overdue and will enrich the current debates on Islam and modernity.
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From reader reviews:

Irene Vaughan:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material if you want something to
explain what yours problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy man? If you don't have spare time
to perform others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have time? What did you do? Every
individual has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question since just their can do that will.
It said that about publication. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is right. Because start from on jardín de
infancia until university need this kind of Quest for Divinity: A Critical Examination of the Thought of
Mahmud Muhammad Taha (Modern Intellectual and Political History of the Middle East) to read.

John Dinwiddie:

This Quest for Divinity: A Critical Examination of the Thought of Mahmud Muhammad Taha (Modern
Intellectual and Political History of the Middle East) book is not ordinary book, you have after that it the
world is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is actually information inside this book
incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you will get.
That Quest for Divinity: A Critical Examination of the Thought of Mahmud Muhammad Taha (Modern
Intellectual and Political History of the Middle East) without we know teach the one who studying it become
critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't always be worry Quest for Divinity: A Critical Examination of the
Thought of Mahmud Muhammad Taha (Modern Intellectual and Political History of the Middle East) can
bring when you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have
it in the lovely laptop even cell phone. This Quest for Divinity: A Critical Examination of the Thought of
Mahmud Muhammad Taha (Modern Intellectual and Political History of the Middle East) having excellent
arrangement in word and layout, so you will not sense uninterested in reading.

Gale Coachman:

The particular book Quest for Divinity: A Critical Examination of the Thought of Mahmud Muhammad Taha
(Modern Intellectual and Political History of the Middle East) has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you
read this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was published by the very famous author. The writer
makes some research prior to write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you can find the point
easily after reading this book.

Keith Robertson:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is prepared or printed or outlined from each source this filled update of news. On
this modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media
social just like newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You



can add your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
seeking the Quest for Divinity: A Critical Examination of the Thought of Mahmud Muhammad Taha
(Modern Intellectual and Political History of the Middle East) when you required it?
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