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Consumerism in China has developed rapidly. The Changing Landscape of China's Consumerism looks at
the growth of consumerism in China from both a socio-economic and a political/cultural angle. It examines
changing trends in consumption in China as well as the impact of these trends on society, and the politics and
culture surrounding them. It examines the ways in which, despite needing to "unlock" the spending power of
the rural provinces, the Chinese authorities are also keen to maintain certain attitudes towards the
Communist Party and socialism "with Chinese Characteristics." Overall, it aims to show that consumerism in
China today is both an economic and political phenomenon and one which requires both surrounding
political culture and economic trends for its continued establishment. The ways in which this dual
relationship both supports and battles with itself are explored through apposite case studies including the use
of New Confucianism in the market context, the commodification of Lei Feng, the new Chinese tourist as a
diplomatic tool in consumption, the popularity of Shanzhai (fake product) culture, and the conspicuous
consumption of China's new middle class.

Provides innovative interdisciplinary research, useful to cultural studies, sociology, Chinese studies, and●

politics
Examines changes in consumerism from multiple perspectives●

Allows both micro and macro insights into consumerism in China by providing specific case studies, while●

placing these within the context of geo-politics and grand theory
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From reader reviews:

Tom Copper:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book especially book
entitled The Changing Landscape of China's Consumerism (Chandos Asian Studies Series) your brain will
drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect that maybe unfamiliar for but surely can be
your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a e-book then become one contact form conclusion and
explanation this maybe you never get just before. The The Changing Landscape of China's Consumerism
(Chandos Asian Studies Series) giving you a different experience more than blown away the mind but also
giving you useful details for your better life with this era. So now let us present to you the relaxing pattern at
this point is your body and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished reading it, like winning a
casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Jonas Jones:

Many people spending their time by playing outside with friends, fun activity with family or just watching
TV all day every day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by studying a book. Ugh, ya think
reading a book can really hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It okay you can have the e-
book, bringing everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like The Changing Landscape of China's
Consumerism (Chandos Asian Studies Series) which is keeping the e-book version. So , try out this book?
Let's see.

Ruby Mejia:

Publication is one of source of information. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students and
also native or citizen will need book to know the revise information of year in order to year. As we know
those guides have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the
world. By book The Changing Landscape of China's Consumerism (Chandos Asian Studies Series) we can
have more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? To get creative person must choose to read
a book. Just simply choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life at
this book The Changing Landscape of China's Consumerism (Chandos Asian Studies Series). You can more
attractive than now.

Marcella Baird:

Some individuals said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a book. They are directly felt this when
they get a half parts of the book. You can choose often the book The Changing Landscape of China's
Consumerism (Chandos Asian Studies Series) to make your reading is interesting. Your current skill of
reading ability is developing when you just like reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy
to read it and mingle the idea about book and reading through especially. It is to be very first opinion for you
to like to wide open a book and examine it. Beside that the publication The Changing Landscape of China's



Consumerism (Chandos Asian Studies Series) can to be your brand new friend when you're really feel alone
and confuse in doing what must you're doing of their time.
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