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Effectively diffusing conflicts at work or at home begins long before the point of volatility. With better
understanding and proven strategies, it is well within anyone’s capacity to offset bad behavior so that it never
reaches the boiling point. Now, conflict resolution expert Susan Mendoza Beller draws from decades of
successful mediation in How to Get Along with Anyone: 63 Strategies for Success, a how-to guide to gain the
insight to preempt volatile situations.

In any given workplace or home, there is always the possibility of encountering personality traits that may
foster detrimental behavior. To successfully address a person’s Achilles Heel, blind spot, or poor judgment,
it is necessary to identify that trait. In sixty-three chapters, Dr. Beller’s well-considered and crystal clear
analysis of these characteristics provides readers with an informed perspective so they can best navigate
interpersonal dynamics well before an escalation.

In addition to highlighting these characteristics, each chapter includes an anecdotal example; a strategy to
successfully manage a possible conflict; and a group activity to apply that strategy. Incorporating methods
from psychology, philosophy, science, and mythology, this indispensable resource will help readers devise
workable solutions before the situation gets out of control.

"The title of Susan Mendoza Beller's "How To Get Along With Anyone" makes a big promise - and Beller,
an international mediation expert, fulfills that promise admirably with sixty-three specific strategies to deal
with even the most difficult personalities. For each strategy, there's a relevant quote, an introduction, a sketch
of a fictional person to illustrate negative behaviors, suggestions for how these behaviors can be modified, an
activity that can be performed as a group, and discussion ideas. Each chapter is, in effect, a self-contained
miniguide that offers a well constructed problem-solution approach to understanding another's point of view
and resolving conflict. It is an impressive feat for Beller to have identified so many different personality
traits and then boiled them down into distinct chapters. Beller writes in her conclusion that the book "is a
journey into the minds of many diverse personalities, and an activity adventure in team building." As such,
"How To Get Along With Anyone" is sure to make for enlightening reading." Barry Silverstein, ForeWord
Clarion Review
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From reader reviews:

Charles Denzer:

Book is definitely written, printed, or created for everything. You can realize everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important point to bring us around the
world. Next to that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A book How to Get Along with Anyone:
63 Strategies for Success will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you
can know about every thing. But some of you think that will open or reading the book make you bored. It
isn't make you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or suitable book
with you?

Jerald Higgins:

Now a day people who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not demand people to be aware of each information they get. How a lot more to
be smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Reading a book
can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information especially this How to Get Along with Anyone: 63
Strategies for Success book because this book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the data in
this book hundred pct guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Edwin Bernal:

This How to Get Along with Anyone: 63 Strategies for Success tend to be reliable for you who want to
certainly be a successful person, why. The explanation of this How to Get Along with Anyone: 63 Strategies
for Success can be one of the great books you must have is usually giving you more than just simple
studying food but feed you with information that might be will shock your previous knowledge. This book
will be handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your conditions in e-book and printed
people. Beside that this How to Get Along with Anyone: 63 Strategies for Success giving you an enormous
of experience for example rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that we understand it useful
in your day activity. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Angela Yoder:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Make an
effort to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't ascertain book by its deal with may
doesn't work here is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as
in the outside look likes. Maybe you answer is usually How to Get Along with Anyone: 63 Strategies for
Success why because the great cover that make you consider regarding the content will not disappoint you
actually. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading sixth sense will
directly assist you to pick up this book.
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