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In the past decade, the developed world has spent almost US$ 2 trillion on foreign aid for poorer countries.
Yet 1.2 billion people still live in extreme poverty and around 2.9 billion cannot meet their basic human
needs.

But should rich nations continue to help the poor? In this short book, leading global poverty analyst David
Hulme explains why helping the world’s neediest communities is both the right thing to do and the wise
thing to do Ð if rich nations want to take care of their own citizens’ future welfare.

The real question is how best to provide this help. The way forward, Hulme argues, is not conventional
foreign aid but trade, finance and environmental policy reform. But this must happen alongside a change in
international social norms so that we all recognise the collective benefits of a poverty-free world.
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From reader reviews:

Jon Gonzalez:

With other case, little men and women like to read book Should Rich Nations Help the Poor (Global
Futures). You can choose the best book if you love reading a book. Providing we know about how is
important a new book Should Rich Nations Help the Poor (Global Futures). You can add know-how and of
course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can recognize
everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple issue until
wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or perhaps searching by internet
system. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's study.

Dan Flood:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading practice give
you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the
book that will improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of reserve you
read, if you want have more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want sense happy read one
with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The Should Rich Nations Help the Poor (Global
Futures) is kind of guide which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Della McDonald:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their family, or their
very own friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, gonna beach, or picnic
within the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something different to
fill your free time/ holiday? May be reading a book may be option to fill your free of charge time/ holiday.
The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to consider look
for book, may be the book untitled Should Rich Nations Help the Poor (Global Futures) can be excellent
book to read. May be it may be best activity to you.

Betty Peoples:

Beside that Should Rich Nations Help the Poor (Global Futures) in your phone, it may give you a way to get
more close to the new knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh
through the oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow community. It is
good thing to have Should Rich Nations Help the Poor (Global Futures) because this book offers to your
account readable information. Do you sometimes have book but you seldom get what it's about. Oh come on,
that would not happen if you have this inside your hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable,
similar to treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss this? Find this book and also read it
from today!
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