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The second edition of The Neurology of Consciousness is a comprehensive update of this ground-breaking
work on human consciousness, the first book in this area to summarize the neuroanatomical and functional
underpinnings of consciousness by emphasizing a lesional approach offered by the study of neurological
patients. Since the publication of the first edition in 2009, new methodologies have made consciousness
much more accessible scientifically, and, in particular, the study of disorders, disruptions, and disturbances
of consciousness has added tremendously to our understanding of the biological basis of human
consciousness. The publication of a new edition is both critical and timely for continued understanding of the
field of consciousness.

In this critical and timely update, revised and new contributions by internationally renowned
researchers—edited by the leaders in the field of consciousness research—provide a unique and
comprehensive focus on human consciousness. The new edition of The Neurobiology of Consciousness will
continue to be an indispensable resource for researchers and students working on the cognitive neuroscience
of consciousness and related disorders, as well as for neuroscientists, psychologists, psychiatrists, and
neurologists contemplating consciousness as one of the philosophical, ethical, sociological, political, and
religious questions of our time.

New chapters on the neuroanatomical basis of consciousness and short-term memory, and expanded●

coverage of comas and neuroethics, including the ethics of brain death
The first comprehensive, authoritative collection to describe disorders of consciousness and how they are●

used to study and understand the neural correlates of conscious perception in humans.
Includes both revised and new chapters from the top international researchers in the field, including●

Christof Koch, Marcus Raichle, Nicholas Schiff, Joseph Fins, and Michael Gazzaniga
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From reader reviews:

Theodore Rios:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by interact with the internet
and the resources included can be true or not call for people to be aware of each info they get. How
individuals to be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Looking
at a book can help people out of this uncertainty Information specifically this The Neurology of
Consciousness: Cognitive Neuroscience and Neuropathology book as this book offers you rich data and
knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred pct guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Blanche Watson:

This The Neurology of Consciousness: Cognitive Neuroscience and Neuropathology usually are reliable for
you who want to become a successful person, why. The explanation of this The Neurology of
Consciousness: Cognitive Neuroscience and Neuropathology can be among the great books you must have is
usually giving you more than just simple reading through food but feed anyone with information that
probably will shock your preceding knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it everywhere you go and
whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed versions. Beside that this The Neurology of
Consciousness: Cognitive Neuroscience and Neuropathology giving you an enormous of experience for
instance rich vocabulary, giving you trial of critical thinking that we know it useful in your day task. So ,
let's have it and revel in reading.

Steven Richardson:

Beside this kind of The Neurology of Consciousness: Cognitive Neuroscience and Neuropathology in your
phone, it could possibly give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or facts. The information
and the knowledge you are going to got here is fresh from oven so don't always be worry if you feel like an
previous people live in narrow community. It is good thing to have The Neurology of Consciousness:
Cognitive Neuroscience and Neuropathology because this book offers to you readable information. Do you
often have book but you rarely get what it's interesting features of. Oh come on, that will not happen if you
have this inside your hand. The Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful
island. Use you still want to miss the item? Find this book in addition to read it from now!

Carol Sage:

Reserve is one of source of information. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen want book to know the up-date information of year to year. As we know those
guides have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the
world. From the book The Neurology of Consciousness: Cognitive Neuroscience and Neuropathology we
can acquire more advantage. Don't you to be creative people? To get creative person must like to read a
book. Just simply choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life at this



time book The Neurology of Consciousness: Cognitive Neuroscience and Neuropathology. You can more
desirable than now.
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