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The first comprehensive monograph on Japan's most creative, experimental and visionary architect,
Sou Fujimoto

Occasionally an architect emerges whose vision is so fresh that it causes us to reconsider the very nature of
architecture. Sou Fujimoto is one of those architects. Guided by instinct and keen observation, he casts
convention aside. Instead he blurs boundaries and routinely rethinks basic building blocks. Both comfortably
familiar and curiously enigmatic, Fujimoto's dynamic work grabs our attention then lingers on in our minds.

Born and bred in Hokkaido, Fujimoto received his undergraduate degree in architecture from Tokyo
University before embarking on an uncharted, solo exploration that probed the possibilities of architecture.
Unfettered by the ideas and practices of others, Fujimoto's work has clarity of thought and purity of
execution seldom seen.

Fujimoto garnered significant international attention for his popular 2013 Serpentine Pavilion in London
(Fujimoto was the youngest architect to receive the highly-regarded commission). In 2012 he was part of the
Japanese team that won a Golden Lion award for Best National Participation at the Venice Architecture
Biennale for their design of alternative housing concepts for the homes that were destroyed by the tsunami.
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From reader reviews:

Jessica Kelly:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the title Sou Fujimoto
suitable to you? Often the book was written by well-known writer in this era. The book untitled Sou
Fujimotois the main of several books in which everyone read now. This particular book was inspired many
men and women in the world. When you read this e-book you will enter the new age that you ever know
prior to. The author explained their thought in the simple way, and so all of people can easily to know the
core of this e-book. This book will give you a wide range of information about this world now. To help you
to see the represented of the world with this book.

Elizabeth Schwartz:

The guide with title Sou Fujimoto contains a lot of information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of
profit after read this book. That book exist new expertise the information that exist in this publication
represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement
of the world. That book will bring you with new era of the globalization. You can read the e-book with your
smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Dolores Albert:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you will
get it in e-book way, more simple and reachable. This Sou Fujimoto can give you a lot of pals because by
you taking a look at this one book you have point that they don't and make you actually more like an
interesting person. This book can be one of one step for you to get success. This guide offer you information
that probably your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than different make you to be great folks. So ,
why hesitate? We need to have Sou Fujimoto.

Kimberly Foust:

As a scholar exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library or make
summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's soul or real their
passion. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time there but
nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring along with can't see
colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As
we know that on this period, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore this Sou Fujimoto can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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