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In the first of a two-volume study, the author presents an extremely detailed record of the Organisation,
doctrine and equipment of US Army infantry divisions during the latter part of World War II. The second
volume will provide capsule histories for all US Army infantry divisions during this period.

After examining the state of the US Army during the 1940- 43 period, Yves Bellanger focuses on the 1943-
45 period, and presents each of the division's sub-units - from the divisional HQ to an infantry battalion,
from the divisional artillery to its combat engineer element. For each, the author examines their Organisation
(down to the lowest level possible), their training and tactical doctrine, in addition to listing all the
equipment, vehicles and weapons they were issued with.

The first volume concludes with a comprehensive set of appendices, including sample command rosters.

Key Features
No equivalent book is available which covers the 1943-45 US Army infantry divisions in comparable detail

An extraordinarily-detailed guide - lists ALL equipment issued to ALL elements of the infantry division,
from an infantry battalion's HQ company, to the division's military police platoon, thus including much
information on rear-area units usually ignored or forgotten

Includes a large number of organizational charts, plus detailed sample command rosters
As well as tactical doctrine, covered in detail, drawing extensively on contemporary US field manuals

The author received extensive assistance from US veterans in writing this book

An essential reference for re-enactors, modelers, war gamers, researchers and anyone who requires a detailed
guide to the US Army during the 1943-45 period
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From reader reviews:

Cheryl Grosvenor:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book
store? Attempt to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't judge book by its handle
may doesn't work this is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in
the outside search likes. Maybe you answer may be US ARMY INFANTRY DIVISIONS 1943 - 1945:
Volume 1 - Organisation, Doctrine, Equipment why because the excellent cover that make you consider
regarding the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or content is fantastic as the outside or
even cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly guide you to pick up this book.

Michael Berry:

In this particular era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more special than
other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you must do is just
spending your time almost no but quite enough to get a look at some books. One of many books in the top
listing in your reading list is US ARMY INFANTRY DIVISIONS 1943 - 1945: Volume 1 - Organisation,
Doctrine, Equipment. This book that is certainly qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in
becoming precious person. By looking up and review this e-book you can get many advantages.

Ryan Young:

You can obtain this US ARMY INFANTRY DIVISIONS 1943 - 1945: Volume 1 - Organisation, Doctrine,
Equipment by browse the bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it could to be your solve problem if
you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this guide are various. Not only by means of written or
printed but also can you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking
by your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your current ways to get more
information about your reserve. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are
still up-date. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.

Jason Rickman:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got students? We believe that that concern
was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And you
know that little person like reading or as reading become their hobby. You must know that reading is very
important in addition to book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to include you knowledge, except
your personal teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update in relation to something by book. Numerous
books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is this US ARMY INFANTRY DIVISIONS
1943 - 1945: Volume 1 - Organisation, Doctrine, Equipment.
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